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GUEST LECTURE 

On  

 HUMANIZING ENGINEERING EDUCATION 

 

 
Report by Dr M.Suresh Babu, MCA HOD 

A Guest Lecture on Humanizing Engineering Education was held on 15
th
 April, 2014 at MITS. 

The Guest Speaker for the event was Justice B.Chandra Kumar, Judge, Andhra Pradesh 
High Court.  Students from UG & PG participated in this memorable Guest Lecture. MCA 
HOD, Principal welcomed the dignitaries. Prof. K.Venkata Reddy, Parivarthana and Dr. 
Narasimhan – Sumavanam, Dr. Narayana Bharath Guptha – Sub Collector Spoke on the 
occasion. Principal honoured the High Court Judge and presented mementos to the 
dignitaries. Songs CD on Voter awareness is released by Justice Chandra Kumar and 
presented the CD to Sub Collector Dr.Narayana Bharat Gupta. The enthusiasm and the 
anticipation amongst not only the students but the lecturers was quite evident. The lecture 
was sweet, simple and crisp.The session ended with a thank you note and a loud and 
cohesive cheering from the audience. Justice B.Chandra Kumar appreciated and thanked the 
management for conducting such a programme in the college.   

About the Program 

A new form of engineering education is needed, one that covers a wide range of technical 
and non technical issues, including water provisioning and purification, sanitation, public 
health, power production, shelter, site planning, infrastructure, food production and 
distribution, and communication. The challenge of creating a sustainable world demands a 
new and holistic look at the role of engineering in society. .. to allow all humans to enjoy a 
quality of life where basic needs of water, sanitation, nutrition, health, safety and meaningful 
work are fulfilled. 
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Humanitarianism has become a progressively expansive project. As part of its expansion, it 
now includes engineering. But like any expansion, this one brings with it not only benefits but 
also challenges. 

Engineers have long been focussed on meeting the needs of humanity. During the past 
century, however, we have become increasingly aware of new dimensions of human need not 
regularly addressed by engineering practice and education in India. Though we have been to 
the moon, sent robots to mars, and can do marvellous things on the mega and nano scales, 
the fact remains that on our special planet, roughly one fifth of the people lack access to clean 
water and 11 million children under the age of five die every year from malnutrition and 
disease. Indeed, even the engineered infrastructure of the developed world will need to 
change in order to secure a sustainable future. Our energy and water consumption, food 
production, and patterns of material consumption will need to change to accommodate a 
habitable world for our descendants. Engineering graduates must understand the global 
constraints they face – physical, economic, environmental, social, political and cultural all 
together – and how to use all available tools as they work toward socially just and sustainable 
solutions. This is a challenge to which humanitarian engineering can make a meaningful 
contribution. In pursuing the goals of humanitarian engineering and humanitarian engineering 
education, it is nevertheless useful to consider tow kinds of challenges: practical and 
theoretical. 

Practical challenges for any humanitarian engineering education program run the gamut from 
what to include in a curriculum and how to include it. Andhra Pradesh is turning into a state of 
surplus, well as far as seats in educational institutions are concerned. After the boom of 
engineering colleges, it's the turn of private junior colleges to outdo the demand with five 
times the supply.  

Where have we come from? 

Admittedly, values education is a complex and controversial area, and it is easy to become 
jaded and possibly daunted by the obstacles it presents. So it may be helpful at the start to 
recall where we have all come from. I would maintain that there has been progress. Looking 
back, I realize that I personally have lived through a period of great change with respect to 
values education a period characterised by staggering social upheavals whose impacts have 
had a far greater influence on educational policy than anything I have written over that period. 
Indeed, for most of the academic life, I have felt that I was banging my head against a brick 
wall. In regard to state education, I was arguing that colleges could not remain value neutral 
and still call themselves “educational” institutions. In regard to non state colleges, I was 
deploring their tendency to presume that their values and practices were beyond criticism.  
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